
Praise for A Foundation for Living Ethically 

 

Fran Murrell, Consultant 

I think you have done an amazing job. I liked the Q-and-A conversation format and the short 
chapters. It made it easier to understand and to see the critique/teasing out of the implications of 
the ideas. It covers a lot of ground and doesn’t get bogged down in detail or in stodgy explanations 
of impenetrable philosophers. 

Nikki Thompson, Coach/Consultant at Inner Circle Work 

I thoroughly enjoyed it. The overall felt sense I had was that you had nailed it. I was left feeling 
curious, and I sense that I will have a subtle shift in my perception as a result. I loved how you 
highlighted personal choice as essential for humans and the need to have that linked with 
responsibility. I liked how you brought the different philosophical views into the conversation – 
Eastern and Western as well as different philosophical frameworks and ideologies. You had lots of 
lovely entry points to help the reader see how we all change, how context impacts on action, and 
how there is always an ecosystem in all things. 

Elissa Farrow, Founder, About Your Transition 

I feel honoured to have had the opportunity to read this book through. It was a good read and it is a 
contemporary topic. I like the session format and found the flow of conversation style mixed with 
theory or broader blocks to be a good balance. I think this is a massive achievement. 

Dr Charmayne Highfield, Adjunct Faculty at Singapore Management University 

I really enjoyed reading the book. It is written in an engaging way, and the conversational style 
should appeal across age ranges. 

Nicolene Murdoch, CEO, The College, Western Sydney University 

The questions the book asks are really powerful, linking ethics and values. It is a guide for an ethical 
life. I like the idea of a conversation. 

Peter Le Breton, Associate Lecturer, Murdoch University 

You have clearly put a lot of deep thought, care and study into your creation. The way you have 
structured the book—as a conversation between, say, an ethicist and a student—is likely to draw 
many readers to your work.  

Audrey Lobo-Pulo, Founder, Phoensight 

Thank you so much for sharing your book with me. I am still going through it, as it holds a wealth of 
information – and I'm absorbing it bit by bit. What I find fascinating in it, is in viewing it from an 
Artificial Intelligence perspective. The core of what you put forward is so relevant right now. Given 
what's happening with the 'surveillance state', machine learning and artificial intelligence, ethics 
today is more important than ever. And I think we're only just grasping it after the onset of perverse 
societal impacts... 

 


